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 The fifth meeting (2024) of the Sai Kung District Council Food, 
Environment and Hygiene Committee (FEHC) was held on 12 September.  The 
major issues discussed at the meeting were summarised as follows: 
 
Food and Environmental Hygiene Department’s Anti-mosquito Campaign 2024 
(Phase III) in Sai Kung District 
 
2. FEHC noted the above report.   
 
Item referred by the Sai Kung District Council: Summary of District Consultation 
on the “Issues of Concern to Sai Kung District – Environmental Hygiene” (Feral 
pigeons and street cleansing/sweeping) 
 
Request for installing artificial intelligence closed-circuit television cameras to 
step up law enforcement actions against illegal feeding of feral pigeons 
 
3. FEHC agreed that the above items should be discussed together.   
 
4. FEHC noted the written replies from the Agriculture, Fisheries and 
Conservation Department (AFCD) and the Food and Environmental Hygiene 
Department (FEHD), and requested AFCD and FEHD to follow up the matters.   
 
5. FEHC agreed to delete the above motion at the next meeting.   
 
Statistics on Environmental Hygiene Service and Itinerant Hawkers in Sai Kung 
District 
 
6. FEHC noted the above reports and requested FEHD to provide 
supplementary information in response to Members’ enquiries.   
 
Issues related to the operation of Temporary Fill Bank at Tseung Kwan O 
Area 137 and the South East New Territories Landfill 
 
7. FEHC noted the above reports and requested the Civil Engineering and 
Development Department to provide supplementary information in response to 
Members’ enquiries.   
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Enhance the efforts in law enforcement, publicity and education in the district so 
as to encourage dog owners to fulfill their responsibilities and keep the streets 
clean 
 
8. FEHC passed the above motion, noted the written reply from FEHD, and 
requested FEHD and AFCD to follow up the matter.   
 
9. FEHC agreed to delete the above item at the next meeting.   
 
Enhance the regulation of dump trucks and road cleanliness to create a safe and 
clean traffic environment at Tseung Kwan O - Lam Tin Tunnel 
 
10. FEHC passed the above motion and noted the written replies from FEHD, 
the Hong Kong Police Force (HKPF), the Highways Department (HyD), the 
Transport Department (TD) and the Environmental Protection Department.  
Moreover, FEHC requested FEHD, HKPF, HyD and TD to follow up the matter.   
 
11. FEHC agreed to delete the above item at the next meeting.   
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